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 The Party Store Brings Party Planning, Event Management,  
Rentals & More to Ka Makana Ali‘i 

 

The locally owned, first-of-its-kind store is a one-stop shop for all party planning needs  
 
KAPOLEI, HI (January 3, 2018) — Ka Makana Ali‘i is excited to welcome The Party Store. The 
locally owned, first-of-its-kind store is the one-stop shop for party supplies, rentals, party 
planning, DIY classes and event management. Owner Leslie Nollie and marketing director 
Kendra Baxter have worked in event management, marketing and rentals for more than 10 
years.  
 
The Party Store is a culmination of their experience and passion. It opened at Ka Makana Ali‘i 
on Wednesday, Dec. 26 in the Macy’s wing between Supercuts and Better Homes & Gardens 
Real Estate. A grand opening celebration is planned for Sunday, Jan. 20 from 12 to 6 p.m. with 
giveaways, DIY stations, face painting, and more! It’s the perfect day to bring the party into the 
store and experience all that The Party Store has to offer.  
 
The storefront sells party supplies like balloons, displays, bouquets, wrapping paper, cards, 
favors, serving platters, centerpieces, craft items and more. In addition to major products, The 
Party Store offers a wide range of event management services, along with rentals, an open 
work space, delivery and printing services. The one-stop shop is staffed with experienced 
employees who are able to help with celebrations of all kinds — from graduation parties to 
baby luau, birthday parties or special events, it’s a store like no other at Ka Makana Ali‘i. 
 
“Kapolei is still growing so it’s kind of a perfect place,” Nollie said. “Ka Makana Ali‘i is known for 
being more than just a shopping center. It brings life to the community and we’re excited to 
partner with the Center for future events.” 
 
The Party Store is designed to be a collaborative environment with a community feel. The idea 
is to have a place where those who are planning parties can meet to discuss creative ideas and 
share event experience. It’s a new way to approach party planning and to do it all in one space, 
saving time and money!  



 
Nollie and Baxter also want to give back to the community by offering keiki of all ages the 
chance to learn about entrepreneurship, business, party planning and more. Ka Makana Ali‘i’s 
newest store will be offering special promotions throughout the year. Stay updated by 
following @thepartystorehawaii on Instagram and Facebook. 
 
Visit www.kamakanaalii.com for more details about upcoming promotions and exciting center 
events. For the latest news and updates, follow Ka Makana Ali‘i on Facebook, Twitter and 
Instagram, all with profile name @kamakanaalii.  
 

### 
 
About Ka Makana Ali‘i  
Ka Makana Ali‘i offers residents and visitors a family-friendly, mixed-use center in the heart of 
Hawai‘i’s fastest growing community. Phase one of the 1.4 million-square-foot Macy’s-
anchored regional mall features more than 125 exciting stores, restaurants, a state-of-the-art 
Consolidated Theatres and the state’s first Hampton Inn & Suites by Hilton on property. Serving 
as the premier gathering place for the community, Ka Makana Ali‘i fulfills the shopping and 
dining demands of West O‘ahu, where more than 80,000 new homes are projected to be 
constructed by 2025. Its convenient location offers excellent highway access, ample parking 
and public transportation for shoppers. A partnership between DeBartolo Development and the 
State Department of Hawaiian Home Lands, Ka Makana Ali‘i will financially support programs 
benefiting Native Hawaiian interests statewide for decades to come. For more information, 
please visit www.kamakanaalii.com. 
 
About JLL 
JLL (NYSE: JLL) is a leading professional services firm that specializes in real estate and 
investment management. Our vision is to reimagine the world of real estate, creating rewarding 
opportunities and amazing spaces where people can achieve their ambitions. In doing so, we 
will build a better tomorrow for our clients, our people and our communities. JLL is a Fortune 
500 company with operations in over 80 countries and a global workforce of 88,000 as of 
September 30, 2018. JLL is the brand name, and a registered trademark, of Jones Lang LaSalle 
Incorporated. For further information, visit jll.com. 
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